
Actions requested by the Overview and Scrutiny Committee 
 
 

Date Action 
Requested 

Action to be Taken Response 

 
18th October 
2011 

 
1 
 

 
Members requested that the 
potential to remove a number of 
unused bin cupboards from council 
properties in order to discourage 
fly tipping be investigated further.  
In particular it was suggested that 
conditions in Mickleton Close 
should be reviewed further. 
 

 
This task may take some time to 
be completed.  Lead Officer, 
Head of Housing, estimated 
completion date, not specified. 
 
TO BE DONE 

 
8th November 
2011 

 
2 
 

 
Members sought clarification on 
who had been commissioned to 
provide care at Dorothy Terry 
House, a specialist rented unit 
‘housing with care’ scheme for 
people with dementia. 
 

 
Relevant information sent by 
email to Members on 9th 
November 2011 
 
DONE 

 
8th November 
2011 

 
3 
 

 
Members requested further 
information on the Council’s 
campaign schedule for reducing 
fly-tipping, food waste, and dog 
fouling in the Borough; and 
increasing rates of recycling. 
 

 
Relevant information sent by 
email to Members on 9th 
November 2011 
 
DONE 

 


